
Tabsheet Bid B18-03, Trash Can Liners 

Make & 
Model Bid

Delivery 
Time

Qty Per 
Case

Case 
Cost 

Cost Per 
Bag

Make & 
Model Bid

Delivery 
Time

Qty Per 
Case

Case 
Cost 

Cost Per 
Bag

Make & 
Model Bid

Delivery 
Time

Qty Per 
Case

Case 
Cost 

Cost Per 
Bag

Large Can Liner 
Pre-Approved By 

FCSS
5000

Berry 

MX3750
3 Weeks 150 $23.89 $0.159 

Berry 

MX3750

7-10

Days
150 $25.51 $0.170 

Heritage 

H7450PK
7 Days 100 $18.48 $0.185 

Small Can Liner 
Pre-Approved By 

FCSS
3500

Berry 

MX2431
3 Weeks 500 $17.03 $0.034 

Berry 

MX2431

7-10

Days
500 $18.18 $0.036 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grand Total $179,055.000 $191,180.000 N/A

Total Cost Large Can Liner $119,450.000 $127,550.000 $138,600.000

Total Cost Small Can Liner $59,605.000 $63,630.000 N/A

Veritiv

Awarded Vendor - Low Bid 

Dade PaperInterline Brands
B18-03, Trash 

Can Liners

NOTES

Etsimated 
Case Quantity
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Make & 
Model Bid

Delivery 
Time

Qty Per 
Case
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Cost Per 

Bag
Make & 

Model Bid
Delivery 

Time
Qty Per 

Case
Case 
Cost 

Cost Per 
Bag

Make & 
Model Bid

Delivery 
Time

Qty Per 
Case

Case 
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Cost Per 
Bag

Make & 
Model Bid

Delivery 
Time

Qty Per 
Case

Case 
Cost 

Cost Per 
Bag

Heritage 

H7450PK
5 Days $100.000 $18.62 $0.186 

Heritage 

H7450PK
10 Days 100 $19.57 $0.196 

Heritage 

H7450PK
7 Days 100 $20.10 $0.201 

Heritage 

H7450PK

7-10 

Days
100 $25.83 $0.258 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Non 

Approved 

Alternate

N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Non 

Approved 

Alternate

N/A N/A N/A N/A

N/A N/A N/A

N/A N/A N/A

N/A

$139,650.000 $146,775.000 $150,750.000 $193,725.000

N/A

Associated Paper School Specialty American Paper & Twine Southeastern Paper
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Make & 
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Case 
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Bag

Make & 
Model Bid

Delivery 
Time

Qty Per 
Case

Case 
Cost 

Cost Per 
Bag

Bid Non 

Approved 

Alternate

N/A N/A N/A N/A

Bid Non 

Approved 

Alternate

N/A N/A N/A N/A

Bid Non 

Approved 

Alternate

N/A N/A N/A N/A

Bid Non 

Approved 

Alternate

N/A N/A N/A N/A

N/A N/A

N/A N/A

N/A N/A

Fordion Packaging Ferguson Enterprises 


